
CUSTOMER 
Airgas Carbonic
2530 Sever Road, STE 300
Lawrenceville, GA 30043
Applied Specialties
33555 Pine Oak Pkwy
Avon Lake, OH 44012
Aquamark Specialties
PO Box 773
Chestland, OH 44026
Baker's Gas & Welding 
1299 N Shoop Ave .12/LB CHECK
Wauseon, OH 43567
BioSafe Systome ALTERNATE GC
22 Meadow St PRO OXIDIZER BOND
East Hartford, CT 06108 $1.75/LB
BOC Gases
7029 Huntley Road
Columbus, OH 43228
Bonded Chemical
2645 Charter Street $0.47/LB $1.96/LB $702.00/ $0.605/LB $0.269/ $1.08/LB $3.35/LB $0.995/ BOND
Columbus, OH 43228 (150LB CYL) DRY TON LB LB 
Brenntag Great Lakes
4420 Harley Davidson Ave
Wauwatosa, WI 53225
Cabot Norit Americas
PO Box 790
Marshall , TX 75671
Carmeuse Lime, Inc.
11 Stanwix St. 21st Floor $205.79/ BOND
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NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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Pittsburgh, PA 15222 TON
Carus Corporation
315 5th Street
Peru, IL 613543
Chemrite, Incs
5202 Belle Wood Court, Ste 104 
Buford, GA 30518
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC
90 East Halsey Road $406.45/ BOND
Parsippany, NJ 07054 .0045 DRY TON
Continental Carbonics
3985 East Harrison Ave.
Decatur, IL 62526
Coyne Chemical
3015 State Road
Croyden, PA 19021
Donau Carbon US
551 N US Hwy 41 $1349/TON BOND
Dunnellon, FL 34432
F2 Industries, LLC
423 Smyrna Square Dr, Suite C
Smyrna, TN 37167
Garry Shanks - POET
3939 N. Webb Rd.
Wichita, KS 67226
GEO Specialty Chemicals
9213 Arch Street Pike
Little Rock, ar 72206
Greer Industries Inc.
P.O. Box 1900 $184.00/ BOND
Morgantown, WV 26507 NET TON
Gulbrandsen Tech.

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



P.O. Box 5523
Clinton, NJ 08809
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc.
18000 Payne Avenue $851/150# $750/ $200/ BOND
Riverview, MI 48193 CYLINDER DRY TON CYLINDER
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.
4321 West 6th St.
Lawrence, KS 66049
Lhoist North America
P.O. Box 488 $307.98/ NONE
Ste. Genevieve, MO 63670 TON
Mississippi Lime Co.
3870 S Lindbergh Blvd, Ste 200 $232.90/ BOND
St Louis, MO 63127 TON DELIVERED
Omni Materials
13 West 2nd Street
Maysville, KY 41056
Praxair
7000 High Grove Blvd.
Burr Ridge, IL 60527
PVS Technologies
10900 Harper Ave.
Detroit, MI 48213
Sal Chemical
3036 Birch Drive $730/ BOND
Weirton, WV 26062 DRY TON
Shannon Chemical Corp.
602 Jeffers Circle #116 $0.484/ $1.27/ CHECK
Exton, PA 19341 LB LB
Sterling Water Technologies
P.O. Box 602
Columbia, TN 38402

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



Thatcher Company of New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 27407 $2.041/ $0.68/LB BOND
Salt Lake City, UT 84172 LB
Thermodyne Engineering
2386 Montana Avenue
Cincinnati, OH 45211
Ulrich Chemical, Inc.
3111 North Post Road
Indianapolis, IN 46226
Univar USA Inc.
4600 Dues Drive $795/DRY TON $3.97/LB BOND
Cincinnati, OH 45267 20000 LB MIN
USALCO, LLC
2601 Cannery Avenue $422.74/DRY TON BOND
Baltimore, MD 21226 $205.90/WET TON
Water Solutions Unlimited
8824 Union Mills Drive
Camby, IN 43116
Welders Services
P.O. Box 6178
Fort Wayne, in 46803
WT Chemical, Inc.
P.O. Box 837
Chagrin Falls, OH 44022

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID


